
Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

Payment Discount

Item Qty U/M U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL

1 2 EA $29,173.75 $58,347.50 $29,728.00 $59,456.00 $29,500.00 $59,000.00 $32,266.68 $64,533.36 $28,796.00 $57,592.00 $32,082.00 $64,164.00 $28,977.00 $57,954.00

2 10 EA $13,809.75 $138,097.50 $14,575.00 $145,750.00 $14,600.00 $146,000.00 $15,288.51 $152,885.10 $13,997.00 $139,970.00 $15,310.00 $153,100.00 $27,787.00 $277,870.00

3 3 EA $27,637.75 $82,913.25 $28,188.00 $84,564.00 $27,940.00 $83,820.00 $30,544.46 $91,633.38 $27,296.00 $81,888.00 $30,372.00 $91,116.00 $13,974.00 $41,922.00

$279,358.25 $289,770.00 $288,820.00 $309,051.84 $279,450.00 $308,380.00 $377,746.00
$23,047.06 $23,906.03 $23,827.65 $25,496.78 $23,054.63 $25,441.35 $31,164.05

$302,405.31 $313,676.03 $312,647.65 $334,548.62 $302,504.63 $333,821.35 $408,910.05

Subtotal
Sales Tax (8.25%)

Freight
(less billing terms)

Other
Evaluation Total

Buyer

Bid Opening

BID #
5515

9/3/2009

Maria Moreno

5.2.
HOBLIT MOTORS

NONE

LYLE NIELSEN
NET 30 DAYS

SAN BERNARDINOCOSTA MESARIVERSIDE SANTA CLARA

Name of Vendor/Company
3. 4.

FRONTIER FORD THEODORE ROBINS FORD
1.

RACEWAY FORD FAIRVIEW FORD SALES
909 592-5349 949 488-0338 909 386-0281

NEW  2010-FORD FOCUS SE MODEL P3F4 DOOR SEDAN 
OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-1N-PZEV

NEW 2010-MINI SPORT UTILITY 4 DOOR, FORD ESCAPE 
HYBRID ELEFTRICE OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-13H

909 386-0292530 666-7992
WOODLAND

909 592-5370 949 515-1325

Description

NEW 2010-MINI SPORT UTILITY 4 DOOR, 4 WD, FORD 
ESCAPE HYBRID ELECTRIC OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-14H

NET 30 DAYS
10%

6.
FAIRWAY FORD

714 579-3828
714 579-3864

7.
BARBER FORD

805 642-6701
805 289-1171

VENTURA
JAN HARMONSON

NET 30 DAYS
NONE

PLACENTIA
MANY HERNANDEZ

90
DESTINATION

90
DESTINATION DESTINATION

60-120

NET 30 DAYSNET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS

DESTINATIONDESTINATION
90-120 60-100

Phone Number

City

DESTINATION

619 449-2379
619 449-8883

GREG PLACEDWANE GALATTI VIRGINIA HARPER/MELINDA LAKE

530 666-7931

FOB Point
Availability (in days)

DESTINATION
120

Quoted By
Payment Terms

TODD EFF
NET 30 DAYS

NONE

Fax Number

$500.00/Each Unit $500.00/Each Unit 10%
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Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

Payment Discount

Item Qty U/M

1 2 EA

2 10 EA

3 3 EA

Subtotal
Sales Tax (8.25%)

Freight
(less billing terms)

Other
Evaluation Total

Buyer

Bid Opening

BID #
5515

9/3/2009

Maria Moreno

Name of Vendor/Company

NEW  2010-FORD FOCUS SE MODEL P3F4 DOOR SEDAN 
OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-1N-PZEV

NEW 2010-MINI SPORT UTILITY 4 DOOR, FORD ESCAPE 
HYBRID ELEFTRICE OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-13H

Description

NEW 2010-MINI SPORT UTILITY 4 DOOR, 4 WD, FORD 
ESCAPE HYBRID ELECTRIC OR EQUAL

Per Specification #T10-14H

Phone Number

City

FOB Point
Availability (in days)

Quoted By
Payment Terms

Fax Number

U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL

$29,335.00 $58,670.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $29,242.00 $58,484.00 $29,368.00 $58,736.00

$13,616.00 $136,160.00 $15,115.00 $151,150.00 NO BID $14,196.00 $141,960.00 $14,323.00 $143,230.00

$27,773.00 $83,319.00 NO BID NO BID $27,702.00 $83,106.00 $27,837.00 $83,511.00

$278,149.00 $151,150.00 $0.00 $283,550.00 $285,477.00
$22,947.29 $12,469.88 $0.00 $23,392.88 $23,551.85

$301,096.29 $163,619.88 $0.00 $306,942.88 $309,028.85

DESTINATION
90-180

DESTINATION 
60-90

12.
STAR FORD
818 502-4613
818 507-9609
GLENDALE

MIKE NICKOLOFF
NET 30 DAYS

NONE

11.
PASO ROBLES FORD

805 239-3673
805 239-2683

PASO ROBLES 
CHARLIE MCCARREN

NET 30 DAYS
NONE

DESTINATION
90-120

10.
 PARADISE CHEVEROLET

VENTURALANCASTER
PAUL HARPER
NET 30 DAYS

$300.00/VEHICLE

9.
 H W HUNTER INC

661 810-8635
425 787-8779

NET 30 DAYS
NONE

8.
REDLANDS FORD

909 793-3211
909 307-3675
REDLANDS

JERRY TIMPER

DESTINATION
60-120
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