
Re-Cap BID #5420
Agricultural Chemicals Herbcides

Bidder
Phone
Fax
Address
Contact

E-mail

Items: Lb/gal. Qty. U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 Aquamaster Herbicide 2.5 gal 7 Container 86.00$        602.00$           89.05$        623.35$           82.76$        579.32$           79.63$        557.41$           88.30$                     618.10$           
2 Diuron 80 DF Herbicide 25 lb 2 Container 65.50$        131.00$           78.50$        157.00$           79.50$        159.00$           81.11$        162.22$           75.25$                     150.50$           
3 Magnify Surfactant 1 gal 15 Container 14.35$        215.25$           15.00$        225.00$           14.40$        216.00$           14.28$        214.20$           14.52$                     217.80$           

 $          948.25  $        1,005.35  $          954.32  $          933.83  $          986.40 
Items: Lb/gal. Qty. U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Aquamaster Herbicide (Liquid) 150 gal 5 Shuttle  $  4,986.00  $     24,930.00  $   4,936.00  $      24,680.00  $  4,507.50  $     22,537.50  $  4,406.98  $     22,034.90  $               4,884.00  $     24,420.00 
2 Round-Up Pro Herbicide (Dry) 150 gal 7 Shuttle  $  4,695.00  $     32,865.00  $   4,800.00  $      33,600.00  $  4,132.50  $     28,927.50  $  4,407.03  $     30,849.21  $               4,132.50  $     28,927.50 
3 Diuron 80 DP Herbicide 25 lb 40 Container  $       65.50  $       2,620.00  $        78.50  $        3,140.00  $       79.50  $       3,180.00  $       81.11  $       3,244.40  $                    75.25  $       3,010.00 
4 Magnify Surfactant 30 gal 10 Container  $     378.00  $       3,780.00  $      441.90  $        4,419.00  $     424.50  $       4,245.00  $     357.52  $       3,575.20  $                  435.60  $       4,356.00 
5 Blazon Herbicide 2.5 gal 55 Case (2/cs)  $     152.20  $       8,371.00  No Bid  $                  -    $     165.00  $       9,075.00  $     151.00  $       8,305.00  $                  162.20  $       8,921.00 
6 Oust Herbicide 3 lb 15 Jugs  $     249.00  $       3,735.00  $      225.00  $        3,375.00  $     264.00  $       3,960.00  $     202.27  $       3,034.05  $                  262.05  $       3,930.75 

 $     76,301.00  $      69,214.00  $     71,925.00  $     71,042.76  $     73,565.25 
Items. Lb/gal. Qty. U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Landmark MP Herbicide (Dry) 22.5 oz. pks 2 Pack  $     180.90  $          361.80  $      191.25  $           382.50  $     186.08  $          372.16  $     181.60  $          363.20  $                  531.36  $       1,062.72 
2 Direz 4L Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 16 Container  $       34.50  $          552.00  $        40.00  $           640.00  $       34.45  $          551.20  $       46.16  $          738.56  $                    40.20  $          643.20 
3 Aquamaster Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 20 Container  $       86.00  $       1,720.00  $        89.05  $        1,781.00  $       82.75  $       1,655.00  $       79.63  $       1,592.60  $                    88.30  $       1,766.00 
4 Round-Up Pro Herbicide(Liquid) 2.5 gal 6 Container  $       87.00  $          522.00  $        82.50  $           495.00  $       70.25  $          421.50  $       80.14  $          480.84  $                    88.80  $          532.80 
5 Pro Spreader Surfactant(Liquid) 1 gal 15 Container  $       16.00  $          240.00  No Bid  $                  -    $       11.90  $          178.50  $       11.16  $          167.40  No Bid  $                  -   

 $       3,395.80  $        3,298.50  $       3,178.36  $       3,342.60  $       4,004.72 
Items. Lb/gal. Qty. U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Landmark XP Herbicide (Dry) 22.50 oz.pk 22 Pack  $     180.90  $       3,979.80  $      191.25  $        4,207.50  $     186.08  $       4,093.76  $     181.60  $       3,995.20  $                  531.36  $     11,689.92 
2 Direz 4L Herbicide (Liquid) 270 gal 1 Shuttle  $  3,645.00  $       3,645.00  $   4,320.00  $        4,320.00  $  3,915.00  $       3,915.00  $  4,984.18  $       4,984.18  $               4,341.60  $       4,341.60 
3 Aquamaster Herbicide (Liquid) 150 gal 2 Shuttle  $  4,986.00  $       9,972.00  $   4,936.50  $        9,873.00  $  4,507.50  $       9,015.00  $  4,406.98  $       8,813.96  $               4,884.00  $       9,768.00 
4 Aquamaster Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 40 Container  $       86.00  $       3,440.00  $        89.05  $        3,562.00  $       82.75  $       3,310.00  $       79.63  $       3,185.20  $                    88.30  $       3,532.00 
5 Magnify Surfactant (Liquid) 1 gal 25 Case (4/cs)  $       57.40  $       1,435.00  $        58.92  $        1,473.00  $       57.60  $       1,440.00  $       14.28  $          357.00  $                    58.08  $       1,452.00 
6 Roundup Pro Herbicide (Liquid) 150 gal 3 Shuttle  $  4,693.00  $     14,079.00  $   4,800.00  $      14,400.00  $  4,132.50  $     12,397.50  $  4,407.03  $     13,221.09  $               4,882.50  $     14,647.50 
7 Direz 4L Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 40 Shuttle  $       34.50  $       1,380.00  $        40.00  $        1,600.00  $       34.45  $       1,378.00  $       46.16  $       1,846.40  $                    40.20  $       1,608.00 
8 Blazon Marking Agent 2.5 gal 2 Shuttle $       76.10 $          152.20 No Bid $                  -   $       82.50 $          165.00  $       75.50  $          151.00 $                    81.10 $          162.20 

 $     38,083.00  $      39,435.50  $     35,714.26  $     36,554.03  $     47,201.22 

Items. Lb/gal. Qty. U/M Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 Landmark MP Herbicide (Dry) 22.50 oz.pk 7 Pack  $     180.90  $       1,266.30  $      191.25  $        1,338.75  $     186.08  $       1,302.56  $     181.60  $       1,271.20  $                  531.36  $       3,719.52 
2 Direz 4L Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 20 Container  $       34.50  $          690.00  $        40.00  $           800.00  $       34.45  $          689.00  $       46.16  $          923.20  $                    40.20  $          804.00 
3 Aquamaster Herbicide (Liquid) 150 gal 1 Shuttle  $  4,986.00  $       4,986.00  $   4,936.00  $        4,936.00  $  4,507.50  $       4,507.50  $  4,406.98  $       4,406.98  $               4,884.00  $       4,884.00 
4 Round-Up Pro Herbicide (Liquid) 2.5 gal 26 Container  $       87.00  $       2,262.00  $        82.50  $        2,145.00  $       70.25  $       1,826.50  $       80.14  $       2,083.64  $                    88.80  $       2,308.80 
5 Magnify Surfactant (Liquid) 1 gal 40 Case (4/cs)  $       57.40  $       2,296.00  $        58.92  $        2,356.80  $       57.60  $       2,304.00  $       56.80  $       2,272.00 58.08  $       2,323.20 
6 Blazon Marking Agent 2.5 gal 1 Container  $       76.10  $            76.10  No Bid  $                  -    $       82.50  $            82.50  $       75.50  $            75.50  $                    81.10  $            81.10 

11,576.40$      11,576.55$      10,712.06$      11,032.52$      14,120.62$      

Total 130,304.45$    -$            124,529.90$    -$           122,484.00$    -$           122,905.74$    -$                         139,878.21$    

Net 30 days None

UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC. YORK INDUSTRIES

909-987-3077

Jack Bramkamp Howard Cheesebrough

WESTERN FARM TARGET SPECIALTY WILBUR ELLIS
County of Ventura             

General Services Agency      
Procurement Services         

951-371-4388/cell 909-802- 909-987-9873 877.515.9408 800.352.3870 x. 1150 949-981-0945
951-371-5960 559.436.0378 562.483.6738 949-858-5415

1011 E. Third Street        7201 Archibald Ave 2787 W. Bullard Ave., #101   15415 S. Marquardt Ave.    2275 E. Locust Circle              
John Laughlin Melinda Medina Dan Wickham

jack.bramkamp@uap.comhowardo@yorkindustries.net dsikes@agriumretail.com
melinda.medina@target-

specialty.com dwickham@wilbur-ellis.com
Net 60 days None None

Delivery ARO 3 days 5 days 2-3 days 1-3 days 5 days

Payment discount

Zone IV – O & M  

 Watershed Protection Dist.  

7150 Walnut Canyon Rd. 
Moorpark CA  93021  

Sub Total
Zone III – O & M

Watershed Protection Dist.  
7150 Walnut Canyon Rd. 

Moorpark CA  93021  
Contact:  Ernie Bravo #805.584.482

Sub Total

Zone III – O & M
Watershed Protection Dist.

 11251 –B Riverbank Dr 
Saticoy  CA 93004

tact:  John Lagomarsino #805.672-2

Sub Total
Zone II – O & M

Watershed Protection Dist.
 11251 –B Riverbank Dr 

Saticoy  CA 93004
tact:  John Lagomarsino #805.672-2

Sub Total

Contact:  John Lagomarsino 

Sub Total 

Zone I – O & M

Watershed Protection Dist.

 11251 –B Riverbank Dr 
Saticoy  CA 93004


