RFP/Bid Number: #

Procurement Department

Buyer Worksheet

2

4

5

MCPEEK'S DODGE OF ANAH

PARADISE CHEVROLETE

5518 CROWN DODGE H W HUNTER INC WEST COVINA MOTORS, INC HOBLIT DODGE
Bid Opening 805 639-8250 714 254-2615 661 810-8635 626 616-3574 530 666-7931
10/21/2009 805 339-9539 714 254-2614 425 787-8779 626 967-5092 530 666-7992
Buyer Ventura, CA Anaheim, CA Lancaster, CA = ' West Covina, CA Woodland Hills, CA
Maria Moreno Richard Schwartz Roger Boyle Paul Harper ‘?ﬁx Tom Williams Dwane Galatti
Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days AN Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
N/A N/A $300.00/ea vehicle 4% $500.00
Destination Destination Destination P Destination Destination
Not indicated 120 Days 90-120 Days g 180 Days 90 Days
ltem| Qty [ uM Description u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P Tit TAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL
New 2010 Dodge Grand Caravan SE 4 DR 7 Passenger \
1 8 EACH Mini-Van or Equal $ 25,814.00 | $206,512.00| $ 21,256.95|$ 170,055.60 | $ 21,329.00 170,632.00 NO BID $ 24,846.00 ($  198,768.00 | $ 23,378.00 [ $ 187,024.00
Specification #T10-8P8
i
)
la 8 EACH |ADD FOR: 8.1 Second Row Bench Seats w/(2) Child Seats NO BID NO BID $ 4325.00($ 34,600.00 "’é NO BID NO BID
1b 8 EACH |ADD FOR: 8.2 Rear Bucket Seats NO BID NO BID NO BID ; -200.00| -1,600.00 NO BID
2
Subtotal $206,512.00, $170,055.60 $ 205,232.00 § 0.00 $ 200,368.00 $ 187,024.00 $ 194,320.00
Sales Tax $17,037.24 $14,029.59 $16,931.64 ) $0.00 $16,530.36 $ 15,429.48 $ 14,088.20
Freight g
(less billing terms) _‘%
Other i
Evaluation Total $223,549.24 $184,085.19 $222,163.64 =l & 0.0 $  216,898.36 $ 202,453.48 $ 208,408.20
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