
Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

Payment Discount

Qty U/M U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL

1 ea $27,393.63 $27,393.63 $28,795.00 $28,795.00 NO BID $33,527.44 $33,527.44

1 ea $22,421.95 $22,421.95 $23,489.00 $23,489.00 $22,928.57 $22,928.57 $27,393.56 $27,393.56

1 ea $20,390.83 $20,390.83 $20,690.00 $20,690.00 NO BID $24,013.81 $24,013.81

3 ea $19,164.50 $57,493.50 $19,496.00 $58,488.00 NO BID $22,783.28 $68,349.84

3 ea $166.00 $498.00 $167.00 $501.00 NO BID $175.00 $525.00

2 ea $30,288.05 $60,576.10 $31,409.00 $62,818.00 $34,816.33 $69,632.66 $36,638.23 $73,276.46

3 ea $21,485.20 $64,455.60 $22,422.00 $67,266.00 $21,918.37 $65,755.11 $26,169.58 $78,508.74

$225,835.98 $233,252.00 $158,316.34 $305,594.85

$16,373.11 $16,910.77 $11,477.93 $22,155.63

$242,209.09 $250,162.77 $169,794.27 $327,750.48

Fax Number

N/A 2% 10%

Quoted By
Payment Terms

Cliff RiceMike Larson John F slavin

626 457-5550

60-120 Days 90-150 Days

Phone Number

City

805 642-0111
805 535-6105

FOB Point
Availability (in days)

Destination
60-90 Days

Net 30 DaysNet 30 Days Net 30 Days

DestinationDestination Destination

626 457-5593
Alhambra, CA

805 963-0448 949-209-8947

Description
New 2010 - Chevrolet Avalanche LS 2WD Crewcab 
130" WB

Spec #T10-2847

180 Days

ADD FOR:  8.1 Option AN3 - Front 40/20/40 Split 
Bench Seat

New 2010 - Chevrolet Impala LS 2 Door Sedan

Spec #T10-2A-PZEV

New 2010 - Full Size Chevrolet Tahoe Special 
Service 4WD SUV

Spec #T10-20SOPT4

New 2010 - Full Size Pickup Chevrolet Silverado 
LS 2WD Ext Cab 143.5" WB

Spec #T10-3971

805 963-1448 949 200-7782
Name of Vendor/Company

N/A

Bob Lewis
Net 30 Days

1.
PARADISE CHEVROLET

2.
WONDRIES FLEET GROUP

3. 4.
REYNOLDS BUICK INLAND CHEVROLET

Hemet, CAVentura, CA Covina, CABuyer

Bid Opening

BID #
5519

9/30/2009

Maria Moreno

Subtotal

Sales Tax
Freight

(less billing terms)

Other
Evaluation Total

Spec #T10-2G

New 2010 - Fullsize Pickup Chevrolet Silverado LS 
2WD Crewcab 143.5" WB

Spec #T10-2863

New 2010- Chevrolet Malibu 4 Door Sedan LS 
W/1FL

bid5519Recap.xls 10/27/2009


