Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

2. 3. b b 6.
MULLAHEY FORD WESTERN TRUCK EXCHANGE | GIBBS TRUCK CENTER BIG T'S FREIGHTLINER VISTA FORD OF OXNARD LOS ANGELES FREIGHTLINER
805-474-2373 805 485-0551 805 983-2408 805 983-6511 909 510-4406
1/8/2009 805-473-0877 805 988-1844 805 288-5135 805 983-2140 909 226-6114
Arroyo Grande, CA Los Angeles, CA Oxnard, CA Oxnard, CA Oxnard, CA Fontana, CA
Maria Moreno Keith Sanbonmatsu Edd Aguilar Alfred Marquez Bob Archuleta Jon Ennis
Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days
N/A N/A N/A 0.5
Destination Destination Destination Destination
90-120 Days 90-120 Days 120 Days 150 Days
Description u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL TOTAL
New 2009 - 2 Axle Dump Truck, 37,000 GVWR
1 ea [Minimum, with Dump Body or Equal
Specification #H09-26-30DT NO BID INCOMPLETE BID 85,543.84 85,543.84 98,922.00 98,922.00 82,872.00 82,872.00 111,043.00 111,043.00
Discount
la ea [13.3.1-Engine 1,046.00 1,046.00 1,250.00 1,250.00 4,500.00 4,500.0000 1,250.00 1,250.00
13.3.2 - Transmission 1,164.00 1,164.00 400.00 400.00 3,500.00 3,500.0000 400.00 400.00
1b ea |Ditch Gate & Spread Apron NO BID 372.00 372.00 372.00 372.0000 500.00 500.00
Subtotal 0.00 0.00 87,753.84 100,944.00 91,244.0000 113,193.00 112,900.00
Sales Tax 0.00 0.00 6362.15 7318.44 6615.19 8206.49 8185.25
Freight
(less billing terms)
Other
Evaluation Total NO BID NO BID 94,115.99 108,262.44 97,859.19 121,399.49 121,085.25
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