
Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

Payment Discount

Item Qty U/M U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL U/P TOTAL
1 8 ea

20,352.18 162,817.44 20,415.29 163,332.32 22,650.00 181,200.00
1a 8 ea 156.00 1,248.00 175.00 1,400.00 195.00 1,560.00

2 3 ea
No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 2 ea
No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 2 ea
19,721.88 39,443.76 20,020.53 40,041.06 20,800.00 41,600.00

5 3 ea
24,040.93 72,122.79 No Bid 24,500.00 73,500.00

275,631.99 204,773.38 297,860.00
19983.32 14846.07 21594.85

736.00

295,615.31 220,355.45 319,454.85

Subtotal
Sales Tax

Freight
(less billing terms)

Other
Evaluation Total

Buyer

Bid Opening

BID #
5469

9/9/2008

Maria Moreno

2.
Liberty Chevrolet

N/A

Bob Lewis
Net 30

Ventura West Covina

Name of Vendor/Company
3.

West Covina Motors
1.

Paradise Chevrolet
626-339-6216

add for: option AN3-frt Split bench seat

ew 2009 Buick LaCrosse CX PZEV4DRSeda
Spec T09-2B

New 2009 Pontiac G6 4dr Sedan
Spec T09-2E

New 2009 Chevrolet Malibu 4Dr SedanLS
Spec T09-2G

New 2009 Chevrolet Malibu 4Dr Sedan Hybri

559-896-5600
Selma

626-867-5092

Description
New 2009 Chevrolet ImpalaLS 4DRSedan 

Spec T09-2A-PZEV

Spec T09-2GH

Net 30 Net 30

VenturaVentura
60 Days 120 Days

Phone Number

City

805-647-0111
805-535-6105

Jeff Nichols Tom Williams

559-896-5000

FOB Point
Availability (in days)

Ventura
60-90 days

Quoted By
Payment Terms

Fax Number

N/A N/A

Bid 5469Misc. Chevrolet and Buick.xls 9/17/2008


