Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

RFP/Bid Number: # 2. 4. 5. 6. 8.
VISTA FORD OF OX BARBER FORD RACEWAY FORD REYNOLDS BUICK/PONTIAC CARMENITA FORD REDLANDS FORD BURCH FORD
805 983-6511 805 642-6701 619 447-2379 805 963-1448 562 921-1411x203 909 793-3211 562 691-5483
805 983-2140 805 289-1171 619 445-8883 805 963-0448 562 404-4990 909 307-3675 562 690-5753
Oxnard Ventura Riverside Covina Santa Fe Springs Redlands La Habra
Maria Moreno Bob Archuletta Jan Harmonson Lyle Nielsen John F. Slavin James K. Blakely Jerry Timper M Hernandez
Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 21 Days Net 30 Net 30
n/a n/a n/a 2% $100.00/per vehicle N/A 10%
Destination Destination Destination Destination Destination Destination Destination
90 days 120 days 120 days 180 days 180 days 120-150 days 160 days
Description u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL u/P TOTAL
1 1 ea Ford Super Duty F-450 DRW Crewcab 176"
Spec. #T09-24DRWCCUT 34,404.00 | $ 34,404.00 | $ 34,949.00 | $  34,949.00 35,073.00|$ 35073.00|$ 3844898 |$ 3844898 |$% 36,325.00|$ 36,325.00($ 36,537.00 | $ 36,537.00 $ 39,753.00 | $ 39,753.00
Tire Fee
Full Size Pickup Single Rear Wheel Ford Super Duty F-
2 2 ea 350 Super Cab 158"
Spec. #T09-23EXAB 20,062.00 | $ 40,124.00 [ $ 19,999.00 | $  39,998.00 20,407.00|$ 40,814.00|$ 2349490 ($ 46,989.80 |$ 20,908.00|$ 41,816.00($ 20,575.00 | $ 41,150.00 $ 22,390.00 | $ 44,780.00
ADD FOR: Adjustable gas and brake pedals NO BID NO BID 3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tire Fee
3 3 ea Ford F-350 DRW 141" WB Super Duty XL
Spec. #T09-24DRW 17,776.00 | $ 53,328.00 | $ 19,999.00 | $  59,997.00 19,170.00 | $ 57,510.00 [$ 24,464.29 |$ 7339287 ($ 1944592 |$ 58337.76|$% 19,120.00$ 57,360.00 $ 20,992.00 | $ 62,976.00
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 Super Duty XL 16,000 GVWR Regular Cab
4 1 ea Dual Rear Wheel Cab/Chassis 141"
Spec. #T09-24DRWUT60 22,572.00 [ $ 22,572.00 | $ 22,500.00 | $ 22,500.00 22,848.00 [ $ 22,848.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 23,453.00 | $ 23,453.00 | $ 22,815.00 | $ 22,815.00 $ 24,706.00 | $ 24,706.00
Tire Fee
5 1 ea
22,687.00 [ $ 22,687.00 | $ 22,450.00 | $ 22,450.00 23,013.00 [ $ 23,013.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 23,619.00|$ 23,619.00 | $ 22,992.00 | $ 22,992.00 $ 25,209.00 | $ 25,209.00
Regular Cab SRW 137" WB 10,100lb GVWR Ford Super
6 2 ea Duty F-350 XL
Spec. #T09-24SRWUT 17,980.00 | $ 35,960.00 | $ 17,790.00 | $ 35,580.00 18,097.00 | $ 36,194.00 | $ 20,892.86 | $ 41,785.72($ 19,085.00 |$ 38,170.00 | $ 18,037.00 | $ 36,074.00 $ 19,790.00 | $ 39,580.00
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 XL Super Duty 16,000lb GVWR Crew Cab
7 1 ea 4WD DRW Cab/Chassis 176"
Spec. #H09-24CCMBT4 36,800.00 | $ 36,800.00 | $ 38,850.00 | $ 38,850.00 39,645.00 [ $ 39,645.00 | $ 44,096.94 [ $ 44,096.94 [$ 39,341.00 | $ 39,341.00 | $ 39,530.00 | $ 39,530.00 $ 43,132.00 | $ 43,132.00
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 XL Super Duty 16,000lb GVWR Regular Cab
8 2 ea 4WD DRW Cab/Chassis 141"
Spec. #H09-24MBT4 33,616.00 | $ 67,232.00 | $ 33,700.00 | $ 67,400.00 34,463.00 [ $ 68,926.00 |NO BID NO BID $ 34,149.00|$ 68,298.00 | $ 34,530.00 | $ 69,060.00 $ 38,290.00 | $ 76,580.00
Tire Fee
Subtotal $ 313,107.00 $ 321,724.00 $ 331,023.00 $ 24471431 $ 329,359.76 $ 325,518.00 $ 329,793.71 $ 356,716.00
Discount $ 4,894.29 $ 1,300.00 $ 35,671.60
$ 239,820.02 $ 321,044.40
Sales Tax $ 22,700.26 $  23,324.99 $  23,999.17 $ 17,386.95 $ 23,878.58 $ 23,600.06 $ 23,910.04 $ 23,275.72
Freight
(less billing terms)
Other
Evaluation Total 335,807.26 345,048.99 355,022.17 262,101.26 353,238.34, 349,118.06 353,703.75 379,991.72
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Procurement Department
Buyer Worksheet

RFP/Bid Number: #
5477
Bid Opening
10/30/2008
Buyer
Maria Moreno
Description
1 1 ea Ford Super Duty F-450 DRW Crewcab 176"
Spec. #T09-24DRWCCUT
Tire Fee
Full Size Pickup Single Rear Wheel Ford Super Duty F-
2 2 ea 350 Super Cab 158"
Spec. #T09-23EXAB
ADD FOR: Adjustable gas and brake pedals
Tire Fee
3 3 ea Ford F-350 DRW 141" WB Super Duty XL
Spec. #T09-24DRW
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 Super Duty XL 16,000 GVWR Regular Cab
4 1 ea Dual Rear Wheel Cab/Chassis 141"
Spec. #T09-24DRWUT60
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 Super Duty XL 16,000 GVWR Regular Cab
5 1 ea Dual Rear Wheel Cab/Chassis 165"
Spec. #T09-24DRWUT84
Tire Fee
Regular Cab SRW 137" WB 10,100lb GVWR Ford Super
6 2 ea Duty F-350 XL
Spec. #T09-24SRWUT
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 XL Super Duty 16,000lb GVWR Crew Cab
7 1 ea 4WD DRW Cab/Chassis 176"
Spec. #H09-24CCMBT4
Tire Fee
Ford F-450 XL Super Duty 16,000lb GVWR Regular Cab
8 2 ea 4WD DRW Cab/Chassis 141"
Spec. #H09-24MBT4
Tire Fee
Subtotal $ 385,826.00
Discount
Sales Tax -
Freight ] ]
(less billing terms) ] ]
Other | ]
Evaluation Total -
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